

JOHNSON, ROSATI, SCHULTZ & JOPPICH, P.C.  
 27555 Executive Drive, Suite 250  
 Farmington Hills, MI 48331  
 (248) 489-4100 Tax ID# 38-3107356

June 16, 2016

City of South Lyon  
 Attn: Lisa Deaton, Clerk/Treasurer  
 335 S. Warren Street  
 South Lyon, MI 48178

Invoice # 1067450

In Reference To: General Labor Matters

Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2016

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/3/2016 PAA Receipt/review correspondence from City Manager	0.20 160.00/hr	32.00
5/5/2016 PAA Receipt/review correspondence from City Manager regarding FLSA issue; Correspondence to City Manager	0.40 160.00/hr	64.00
5/17/2016 PAA Attend POLC and POAM bargaining sessions	7.20 160.00/hr	1,152.00
5/19/2016 PAA Receipt/review correspondence from and correspondence to City Manager; Telephone conference with mediator	0.20 160.00/hr	32.00
5/20/2016 PAA Telephone conference with mediator	0.20 160.00/hr	32.00
5/26/2016 PAA Telephone conference with City Manager regarding discipline issue	0.20 160.00/hr	32.00
For professional services rendered	<u>8.40</u>	<u>\$1,344.00</u>
Previous balance		\$2,920.40

Johnson, Rosati, Schultz & Joppich, P.C.

	<u>Amount</u>
5/26/2016 Payment - thank you. Check No. 69183	<u>(\$2,920.40)</u>
Balance due	<u><u>\$1,344.00</u></u>

---

Please include your Invoice Number on your payment. All payments should be mailed to the Farmington Hills' office listed above. Thank you.

JOHNSON, ROSATI, SCHULTZ & JOPPICH, P.C.  
 27555 Executive Drive, Suite 250  
 Farmington Hills, MI 48331  
 (248) 489-4100 Tax ID# 38-3107356

June 16, 2016

City of South Lyon  
 Attn: Lisa Deaton, Clerk/Treasurer  
 335 S. Warren Street  
 South Lyon, MI 48178

Invoice # 1067451

In Reference To: Michigan Tax Tribunal Matters

Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2016

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>Gateway Commons/Docket 16-499</u>		
5/26/2016 SSM Review/receipt of email from City Manager; Review Petition	0.30 130.00/hr	39.00
5/27/2016 SSM Telephone conference with City Manager	0.20 130.00/hr	26.00
SSM Preparation of Answer and Affirmative Defenses; Correspondence regarding same	1.20 130.00/hr	156.00
Subtotal:	[ 1.70	221.00]
For professional services rendered	1.70	\$221.00
Previous balance		\$104.00
5/26/2016 Payment - thank you. Check No. 69183		(\$104.00)
Balance due		<u>\$221.00</u>

Johnson, Rosati, Schultz & Joppich, P.C.

---

Please include your Invoice Number on your payment. All payments should be mailed to the Farmington Hills' office listed above. Thank you.

JOHNSON, ROSATI, SCHULTZ & JOPPICH, P.C.  
27555 Executive Drive, Suite 250  
Farmington Hills, MI 48331  
(248) 489-4100 Tax ID# 38-3107356

June 16, 2016

City of South Lyon  
Attn: Lisa Deaton, Clerk/Treasurer  
335 S. Warren Street  
South Lyon, MI 48178

Invoice # 1067452

In Reference To: City Attorney Retainer Work

Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2016

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>Arcadis</u>		
5/16/2016 TSW Telephone conference with D. Martin at ASTI regarding 128 S. Lafayette and Arcadis and proposed restrictive covenant	0.30	
5/17/2016 TSW Telephone conference with and correspondence to R. Anderson at ASTI regarding environmental consulting for 128 S. Lafayette	0.30	
5/18/2016 TSW Receipt/review correspondence from Gustan Taylor regarding environmental consultant for City	0.10	
5/25/2016 TSW Telephone conference with R. Anderson at ASTI regarding 128 S. Lafayette and restrictive covenant; Correspondence to same regarding City's wellhead protection plan	0.60	
5/27/2016 TSW Correspondence to City Manager regarding status of obtaining proposal for environmental consultant	0.10	
<b>SUBTOTAL:</b>	<b>[ 1.40</b>	<b>]</b>

Johnson, Rosati, Schultz & Joppich, P.C.

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>City Council</u>		
5/5/2016 TSW Receipt/review of Council packet	0.30	
5/9/2016 TSW Attend Council meeting	2.20	
5/23/2016 TSW Preparation for and attend Council meeting	3.20	
SUBTOTAL:	[ 5.70	]
<u>District Court Prosecutions</u>		
5/2/2016 DWG Receipt/review of incident report	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Order for Discharge from Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Order for Discharge from Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Order for Discharge from Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Sentencing Order	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Petition and Order for Amendment of Order of Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judgment of Sentence	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of 5/2/16 arraignment docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's updated 5/3/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's updated 5/3/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' updated 5/3/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of 5/9/16 arraignment docket	0.10	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/2/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 5/9/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 5/9/16 docket	0.10	
5/3/2016 DWG Prosecute morning docket of Pretrial Conferences	1.70	
DWG Receipt/review of email from Det. J. Tomanek with color copies of photographs and text message sent by victim after assault	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of email from Defendant's Attorney L. Pioli with demand for discovery	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of facsimile from Det. T. Tomanek with copy of citation	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Preparation of email to Defendant's Attorney L. Pioli regarding receipt of demand for discovery, color copies of photographs and request for modification of conditional release to allow Defendant to return to property	0.30	
DWG Receipt/review of 5/10/16 arraignment docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 5/10/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 5/10/16 docket	0.10	
5/4/2016 DWG Review of file; Preparation of Subpoenas for 5/19/16 Jury Trial	0.50	
DWG Telephone conference with Det. J. Tomanek regarding pending warrant request	0.20	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/4/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and/or Order to Show Cause	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review Motion and Summons Regarding Probation Violation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Order of Acquittal/Dismissal	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Order for Discharge from Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of incident report	0.20	
5/5/2016 DWG Receipt/review of email from Defendant's Attorney L. Pioli with proposed Stipulated Order to modify bond; Review same; Preparation of email correspondence to L. Pioli regarding same	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's 5/12/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 5/12/16 docket	0.10	
5/6/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and/or Order to Show Cause	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judgment of Sentence	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judgment of Sentence	0.10	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/6/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Order Amending Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judgment of Sentence	0.10	
5/9/2016 DWG Office conference with T. Wilhelm regarding signage at South Lyon Auto Wash	0.20	No Charge
DWG Telephone conference with D. Smith regarding signage at South Lyon Auto Wash	0.20	
DWG Telephone conference with witness regarding 5/19/16 Jury Trial	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of email from City Manager regarding issuance of citation for prohibited signage at South Lyon Auto wash; Telephone conference with D. Smith regarding same	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Summons Regarding Probation Violation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and/or Order to Show Cause	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Summons Regarding Probation Violation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and/or Order to Show Cause	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/9/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's 5/16/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 5/16/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 5/16/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of warrant request; Correspondence to Det. J. Tomanek denying same	0.40	
5/10/2016 DWG Prosecute morning docket of Pretrial Conferences	3.60	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Order of Acquittal/Dismissal	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judgment of Sentence	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Order of Acquittal/Dismissal	0.10	
DWG Begin preparation for 6/19/16 Jury Trial	0.80	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's 5/17/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 5/17/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 5/17/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of email from Det. J. Tomanek with updated contact information for victim and individual copies of photographs from incident	0.20	
DWG Preparation of email to Chief L. Collins regarding appeal of Court of Appeals ruling on warrantless arrest for OWI	0.20	
5/11/2016 DWG Receipt/review of email from Det. J. Tomanek concerning request from Defendant's Attorney for release of Defendant's cell phone; Preparation of email correspondence in response to same	0.20	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/12/2016 DWG Receipt/review of email from Defendant's Attorney L. Pioli regarding revision to proposed Stipulated Order to Modify Bond; Review same; Preparation of email correspondence in response to same	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's updated 5/17/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's updated 5/17/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' updated 5/17/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice of Release	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice of Release	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Batchik's 5/19/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's 5/19/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 5/19/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 5/19/16 docket	0.10	
5/13/2016 DWG Telephone conference with victim regarding 5/17/16 Pretrial Conference and 5/19/16 Jury Trial	0.30	
5/16/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's updated 5/17/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's updated 5/17/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' updated 5/17/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's 5/18/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 5/18/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 5/18/16 docket	0.10	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/16/2016 DWG Preparation of Jury Instructions	0.50	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's updated 5/1/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's updated 5/17/16	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' updated 5/17/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's 5/23/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 5/23/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 5/23/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of email from D. Smith regarding status of compliance	0.20	
5/17/2016 DWG Prosecute morning docket of Pretrial Conferences	2.20	
DWG Telephone conference with victim regarding adjournment of 5/19/16 Jury Trial to 6/2/16	0.20	
DWG Telephone conference with witness regarding adjournment of 5/19/16 Jury Trial to 6/2/16	0.20	
DWG Preparation of email to Defendant's Attorney L. Pioli with full-size photographs and clean copies of Defendant's written statements	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Order from Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Order for Discharge from Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Petition and Order for Amendment of Order of Probation	0.10	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/17/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Petition and Order for Amendment of Order of Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Order for Discharge from Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Office conference with T. Wilhelm regarding Chief of Police's review of application for food truck license	0.20	No Charge
5/18/2016 DWG Receipt/review of 5/24/16 arraignment docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's 5/24/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 5/24/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 5/24/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and/or Order to Show Cause	0.10	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/18/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Summons Regarding Probation Violation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judgment of Sentence	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's 5/25/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 5/25/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 5/25/16 docket	0.10	
5/19/2016 DWG Receipt/review of email from L. Ladner and T. Lyon regarding off-premise signage at South Lyon Auto Wash	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review correspondence from Center for Forensic Psychiatry regarding date for forensic examination; Preparation of email correspondence to requesting incident report and criminal history	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Sentencing Order	0.10	
DWG Preparation of email to Det. J. Tomanek regarding scheduled Jury Trial date; regarding scheduled Bench Trial date	0.20	
5/20/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's updated 5/24/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's updated 5/24/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' updated 5/24/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Batchik's 5/26/16 docket	0.10	
5/23/2016 DWG Telephone conference with Defendant's Attorney D. Burgess requesting adjournment of 5/24/16 Pretrial Conference	0.20	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/23/2016 DWG Receipt/review of email from Defendant's Attorney D. Burgess with proposed Stipulation and Order to Adjourn 5/24/16 Pretrial Conference; Preparation of email correspondence to Attorney Burgess regarding same	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of Order of Acquittal/Dismissal	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Order for Discharge from Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Order for Discharge from Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Order of Acquittal/Dismissal	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Sentencing Order	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Petition and Order for Amendment of Order of Probation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judgment of Sentence	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judgment of Sentence	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Petition and Order for Amendment of Order of Probation	0.10	
DWG Telephone conference with victim's Attorney K. Kecskes regarding status of vicious animal prosecution	0.20	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/23/2016 DWG Preparation of Subpoenas for 6/2/16 Jury Trial	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's updated 5/24/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's updated 5/24/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' updated 5/24/16 docket	0.10	
5/24/2016 DWG Prosecute morning docket of Pretrial Conferences	1.40	
DWG Receipt/review of Judgment of Sentence	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review Notice to Appeal	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and/or Order to show Cause	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Summons Regarding Probation Violation	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judgment of Sentence	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Preparation of Subpoenas for 6/21/16 Bench Trial	0.20	
DWG Correspondence to Lt. C. Sovik regarding service of Subpoenas for 6/21/16 Bench Trial	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's updated 5/25/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's updated 5/25/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' updated 5/25/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Compile incident report, copy of City Code Section 58-51 and criminal history; Correspondence to Center for Forensic Psychiatry regarding same	0.40	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/25/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Motion and Order for Discharge from Probation.	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of 5/31/16 arraignment docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's 5/31/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 5/31/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 5/31/16 docket	0.10	
5/26/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Judge Batchik's 6/2/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's 6/2/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 6/2/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 6/2/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Sentencing Order	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Sentencing Order	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Order of Acquittal/Dismissal	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judgment of Sentence	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's 6/1/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 6/1/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 6/1/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Batchik's updated 6/2/16 docket	0.10	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/26/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's updated 6/2/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's updated 6/2/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' updated 6/2/16 docket	0.10	
5/27/2016 DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's updated 5/31/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's updated 5/31/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' updated 5/31/16 docket	0.10	
5/30/2016 DWG Continued preparation for 6/2/16 Jury Trial	1.60	
5/31/2016 DWG Prosecute morning docket of Pretrial Conferences	2.30	
DWG Receipt/review of email regarding legality of possession of stun gun	0.20	
DWG Telephone conference with victim regarding 5/31/15 Pretrial Conference	0.20	
DWG Telephone conference with complainant regarding 6/2/16 Jury Trial	0.20	
DWG Telephone conference with witness regarding 6/2/16 Jury Trial	0.20	
DWG Preparation of email to Lt. C. Sovik regarding dispositions on 5/31/16 Pretrial Conferences	0.20	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review Notice to Appear	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Order of Acquittal/Dismissal	0.10	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/31/2016 DWG Receipt/review of 6/1/16 arraignment docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Bondy's 6/1/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Law's 6/1/16 docket	0.10	
DWG Receipt/review of Judge Reeds' 6/1/16 docket	0.10	
	<hr/>	
SUBTOTAL:	[ 39.40	]

Elections

5/2/2016 TSW Telephone conference with clerk regarding resolution for temporarily moving Precincts 2 and 3 locations for August election	0.10	
5/3/2016 TSW Review of resolution to relocate polling location for Precincts 2 and 3	0.40	
5/4/2016 TSW Edit/revise draft resolution to relocate polling location for Precincts 2 and 3; Correspondence to City Clerk regarding same	0.40	
	<hr/>	
SUBTOTAL:	[ 0.90	]

General City Attorney Work

5/2/2016 TSW Receipt/review correspondence from and telephone conference with City Manager regarding Lyon Township property request for utility service	0.30	
TSW Telephone conference with B. Langan regarding township parcel and utilities	0.20	
TSW Edit/revise letter to Township regarding resolution; Correspondence to City Manager regarding same	0.60	
5/3/2016 TSW Receipt/review correspondence from and correspondence to City Manager regarding LV Holdings and Lyon Township	0.60	

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/5/2016	DWG Office conference with T. Wilhelm regarding prohibited signage at South Lyon Auto Wash (LeChevalier)	0.20	No Charge
	DWG Receipt/review of notice of violation issued for prohibited signage at South Lyon Auto Wash; Review Sign Ordinance (LeChevalier)	0.40	
	TSW Telephone conference with City Manager regarding Auto Wash sign and enforcement and food trucks	0.30	
	TSW Meeting with Dave Gillam regarding sign ordinance violation enforcement	0.20	No Charge
	TSW Telephone conference with Property Manager regarding 1092 Paddock Lexington Place deck/patio restriction	0.20	
	TSW Telephone conference with Council Member Kivell regarding mobile food vending	0.10	
	TSW Continued review of and edit draft decorative street sign agreement	0.40	
	TSW Correspondence to Building Official and Police Chief regarding Auto Wash sign ordinance violations and enforcement	0.30	
5/6/2016	TSW Telephone conference with City Manager regarding mobile food vendor and sponsor licensing	0.40	
	TSW Telephone conference with Property Manager regarding 1092 Paddock and deck restriction	0.20	
	TSW Preparation of redacted legal invoice for April	0.30	No Charge
5/9/2016	TSW Telephone conference with City Manager regarding mobile food vendor licensing, gas franchise, signs and miscellaneous	0.30	
5/10/2016	TSW Receipt/review of multiple correspondence from City Manager and Fire Chief regarding mobile food vending licensing procedures	0.10	

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/10/2016	TSW Multiple correspondence to City Clerk regarding public notice of gas franchise ordinance	0.30	
	TSW Receipt/review of multiple correspondence to City Clerk regarding public notice of gas franchise ordinance	0.30	
	TSW Telephone conference with City Clerk regarding peddlers and mobile food vendors licensing	0.20	
	TSW Receipt/review correspondence from and correspondence to Trotters Pointe Association regarding decorative street sign agreement; Edit/revise draft agreement	0.80	
5/11/2016	TSW Telephone conference with DPW Director regarding decorative street sign agreement	0.30	
	TSW Continued preparation of decorative street sign agreement; Correspondence to Association	1.10	
5/12/2016	TSW Receipt/review correspondence from and telephone conference with City Manager regarding special event application	0.50	
5/16/2016	TSW Review of Matcat Insurance for tournament; Correspondence to City Manager regarding adding City as additional insured	0.30	
	TSW Telephone conference with City Manager regarding mobile food vending licenses and background checks	0.40	
	TSW Telephone conference with Police Chief regarding background check for mobile food vendors	0.30	
	TSW Research regarding background checks for local permitting	0.30	
5/17/2016	TSW Continued research regarding background checks and review Mobile Food Vending Ordinance	1.30	
	TSW Telephone conference with Police Chief regarding background check for mobile food vendor	0.30	

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/17/2016	TSW Telephone conference with City Manager regarding POAM and POLC negotiations	0.10	
	TSW Telephone conference with City Manager regarding mobile food vendor background check	0.10	
5/19/2016	TSW Research mobile food vending ordinance and background check provisions and procedures	1.10	
	TSW Multiple telephone conferences with City Manager and police chief regarding background check	0.50	
5/20/2016	TSW Receipt/review of correspondence from Association regarding street sign agreement	0.10	
	TSW Multiple telephone conferences with and email with Police Chief regarding mobile food vendor background check, redact ICHAT and CLEMIS reports, and review partial denial letter	1.40	
	TSW Telephone conference with Police Chief regarding decorative street sign agreement	0.10	
	TSW Receipt/review correspondence from E. Cottongim regarding background check and mobile food vending ordinance	0.10	
	TSW Legal research regarding background checks	0.70	
5/23/2016	TSW Telephone conference with R. Anderson at ASTI regarding environmental consulting for 128 S. Lafayette	0.10	No Charge
	TSW Telephone conference with City Manager regarding special events and mobile food vendors	0.20	
	TSW Receipt/review correspondence from and correspondence to City Manager regarding mobile food vendors and MatCats sand wrestling tournament	0.20	
	TSW Correspondence to E. Cottongim regarding mobile food vending background check	0.20	

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/23/2016	TSW Receipt/review multiple correspondence from City regarding schedule for Cultural Arts Commission meeting; Telephone conference with City Manager regarding accounting issue for Cultural Arts Commission events and activities	0.40	
	TSW Receipt/review correspondence from and correspondence to Council Member Kivell regarding mobile food vending issues	0.30	No Charge
5/25/2016	TSW Telephone conference with Council Member Kivell regarding mobile food vending ordinance and application procedure	0.40	No Charge
5/26/2016	TSW Receipt/review correspondence from Police Chief regarding Blues Brews and Brats special event application	0.10	
	TSW Receipt/review correspondence from Police Chief regarding MatCat's insurance for special event	0.10	
	TSW Telephone conference with City Manager regarding city changeable message sign and Capernaemum Clinic	0.20	
	TSW Correspondence to City bookkeeper regarding garnishment interrogatory answers	0.20	
5/30/2016	TSW Review of decorative street sign agreement for Trotters Pointe	0.20	
5/31/2016	TSW Receipt/review correspondence from City Manager regarding resident complaint regarding fence permit administration	0.10	
	TSW Edit/revise decorative street sign agreement for Trotters Pointe	0.50	
	TSW Receipt/review correspondence from City Manager regarding dangerous building hearing officer	0.10	
	TSW Receipt/review correspondence from and correspondence to City Manager regarding Lyon Auto Wash sign violations	0.10	

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
SUBTOTAL:	[ 19.10	]
<u>Glen Meadows</u>		
5/12/2016 TSW Telephone conference with DPW Director regarding utility dedications	0.20	
5/13/2016 TSW Attend meeting at City regarding roadway dedication	1.50	
SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.70	]
<u>METRO Act</u>		
5/3/2016 TSW Correspondence to City Manager regarding McLeod USA request for extension of METRO Act permit	0.20	
5/5/2016 TSW Telephone conference with, correspondence to and Receipt/review correspondence from City Manager regarding McLeod USA METRO Act extension	0.40	
5/6/2016 TSW Correspondence to and from City Manager regarding McLeod USA request for extension of Unilateral METRO Act permit; Review letter recommending approval; Preparation of agenda note for Council	0.60	
SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.20	]
<u>Ordinance Amendment</u>		
5/3/2016 TSW Telephone conference with and receipt/review correspondence from opposing counsel regarding Consumers Energy gas franchise ordinance status	0.30	
5/5/2016 TSW Review of gas franchise ordinance revisions; Correspondence to Clerk and City Manager regarding same	0.50	

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/5/2016	TSW	Correspondence to and from opposing counsel regarding gas franchise ordinance	0.40
5/6/2016	TSW	Receipt/review correspondence from Consumers Energy Legal Department regarding revisions to proposed franchise ordinance language	0.20
	TSW	Review of proposed amendments to sign ordinance	0.60
5/9/2016	GLD	Consumer Franchise: Review with T. Wilhelm regarding revisions and Charter requirements	0.40
	TSW	Telephone conference with and multiple correspondence to J. Pintar at Consumers Energy regarding gas franchise ordinance	0.20
	TSW	Continued preparation of gas franchise ordinance and related documents	1.80
5/10/2016	TSW	Receipt/review correspondence from Consumers Energy regarding gas franchise ordinance revisions	0.20
5/11/2016	TSW	Receipt/review correspondence from and telephone conference with Planning Consultant regarding sign ordinance revisions and review of ordinance	1.60
5/13/2016	TSW	Continued legal research regarding gas franchise ordinance	0.50
5/16/2016	TSW	Research regarding gas franchise issues	0.30
5/17/2016	TSW	Review of Consumers Energy revisions to franchise ordinance	0.50
	TSW	Telephone conference with Consumers Energy regarding franchise ordinance	0.80
	TSW	Legal research regarding gas franchise expiration	0.50
5/20/2016	TSW	Continued preparation of revised gas franchise ordinance, agenda note, public notice and legal research regarding expiration of franchise; Correspondence to Council	2.20

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/23/2016	TSW	Receipt/review correspondence from Consumers Energy legal department regarding gas franchise ordinance	0.10
5/25/2016	TSW	Telephone conference with and receipt/review correspondence from and correspondence to City Clerk regarding gas franchise public notice	0.50
5/31/2016	TSW	Receipt/review correspondence from Planning Commission regarding sign ordinance amendments	0.10 No Charge

SUBTOTAL: [ 11.70 ]

Planning Commission

5/12/2016	TSW	Attend Planning Commission meeting	2.60
5/26/2016	TSW	Attend Planning Commission meeting	2.20

SUBTOTAL: [ 4.80 ]

Thomasville Site Condo

5/23/2016	TSW	Receipt/review correspondence from opposing counsel regarding Master Deed and bylaws for Thomasville condo and Planned Development	0.20
5/25/2016	TSW	Review of Planning Commission approvals of preliminary planned development rezoning and site plans	0.40

SUBTOTAL: [ 0.60 ]

Zoning Board of Appeals

5/12/2016	TSW	Receipt/review of Zoning Board of Appeals packet and agenda	0.10
5/19/2016	TSW	Attend Zoning Board of Appeals meeting	1.70

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.80	]
For professional services rendered	88.30	\$9,850.50
<u>Additional charges:</u>		
	<u>Qty/Price</u>	
<u>City Council</u>		
5/9/2016 Photocopies - Council Packet	280 0.20	56.00
SUBTOTAL:	[	56.00]
<u>District Court Prosecutions</u>		
5/4/2016 Photocopies - Warrant Request	16 0.20	3.20
5/10/2016 Color Photocopies - photographs	15 0.50	7.50
5/25/2016 Photocopies - Center For Forensic documents	69 0.20	13.80
Postage regarding	3 1.67	5.01
SUBTOTAL:	[	29.51]
<u>Thomasville Site Condo</u>		
5/30/2016 Photocopies - Bylaws, Exhibit B and Master Deed	59 0.20	11.80

City of South Lyon  
City Attorney Retainer Work

Page 24

	<u>Qty/Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
SUBTOTAL:		[ 11.80]
Total costs		\$97.31
Total amount of this bill		\$9,947.81
Previous balance		\$9,915.94
5/26/2016 Payment - thank you. Check No. 69183		(\$9,915.94)
Balance due		\$9,947.81

Please include your Invoice Number on your payment. All payments should be mailed to the Farmington Hills' office listed above. Thank you.

Monthly flat fee of \$9,000.00 for first 80 hours of work. Anything over 80 hours to be billed at the hourly rate of \$135.00

Johnson, Rosati, Schultz & Joppich, P.C.